
PRINTED AT THE DEPARTMENT OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, SRI LANKA

TO BE PURCHASED AT THE GOVERNMENT PUBLICATIONS BUREAU, COLOMBO 1

Price :  Rs. 4.25  Postage  :  Rs. 5.00

PARLIAMENT  OF  THE  DEMOCRATIC
SOCIALIST  REPUBLIC  OF

SRI  LANKA

Published as a Supplement to Part II of the Gazette of the Democratic
Socialist Republic of Sri Lanka of  May 06, 2005

—————————

—————————

[Certified on 6th May, 2005]

Printed  on  the  Order  of  Government

—————————

SOCIETIES ORDINANCE (AMENDMENT)
ACT,  No.  11  OF  2005



Societies Ordinance (Amendment) Act, No. 11 of 20051

Short title.

2 – P.L. 000070– 5,650 (02/2005)

[Certified on 6th May, 2005]

L. D. —O. 101/2003.

AN ACT TO AMEND THE SOCIETIES ORDINANCE

BE it enacted by the Parliament of the Democratic Socialist
Republic of Sri Lanka as follows :—

1. This Act may be cited as the Societies Ordinance
(Amendment) Act, No. 11  of 2005

2. Section 9 of the Societies Ordinance (Chapter 123)
(hereinafter referred to as “principal enactment”) is hereby
amended as follows :—

(1) in subsection (3) of that section, by the substitution
for all the words from “recoverable as such” to the
end of that subsection, of the words “recoverable in
an action filed in the District Court”;

(2) in subsection (4) of that section, by the substitution
for the words “two thousand five hundred” of the
words “five hundred thousand”;

(3) in subsection (5) of that section, by the substitution
for the words “two thousand five hundred” of the
words “five hundred thousand”; and

(4) in subsection (8) of that section, by the substitution
for the words “A person under the age of twenty-one
but above the age of sixteen” of the words” A person
under the age of eighteen years, but above the age
of sixteen.”.

3. Section 17 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution for the words “receive more
than two thousand rupees by way of gross sum, together with
any bonuses or additions declared up on assurances not

Amendment
of section 9
of Chapter
123.

Amendment
of section 17
of the
principal
enactment.



2 Societies Ordinance (Amendment) Act, No. 11 of 2005

exceeding that amount or five hundred rupees a year” of the
words “receive more than twenty five thousand rupees by
way of gross sum together with any bonuses or additions
declared up on assurances not exceeding that amount or five
thousand rupees a year.”.

4. In the event of any inconsistency between the Sinhala
and Tamil texts of this Act, the Sinhala text shall prevail.

Sinhala text to
prevail in case of
any inconsistency.



Societies Ordinance (Amendment) Act, No. 11 of 20053

Annual subscription of English Bills and Acts of the Parliament Rs. 885 (Local), Rs. 1,180
(Foreign), payable to the SUPERINTENDENT, GOVERNM ENT PUBLICATIONS BUREAU, NO. 32, TRANSWORKS HOUSE,
LOTUS ROAD, COLOMBO 01 before 15th December each year in respect of the year following.


