SOCIALIST REPUBLIC OF
SRI LANKA

YU IR AL, LA

MUNICIPAL COUNCILS AND URBAN
COUNCILS (AMENDMENT)
ACT, No. 39 OF 1986

{Cerxtified on 12¢h November, 1986}

CPrinted on the Orders of Governmeni

L0 S PR N P TR

Published as a Supplemeat to Part IT of the Gazette of the Democratie
Socislist Republic of Sri Lanka of Ncvember 14, 1986

e R L TR G A LA N

PEIRTED AT TEE DEPANMENT OF (OVDRUYATENT PRINTING, SR LANEA

O BE PURCHASED AT THE GOVERNMENT FUBLICATIONS BUREAU, COLOMBO

Price : Re. 1.50 A Postage : Re. 1.15



Municipal Councils and Urban Councils
(Amendment) Act, No. 39 of 1986
[Certified on 12th November 1986]
L D.—O 58/65 |

AN AcT TO AMEND THE MuNIcipAL COUNCILS ORDINANCE
' AND THE UrBAN CouNnciLs ORDINANCE

BE it enacted by the Paﬂiament of the Democratic Socialist
Republic of Sri Lanka as follpws —

1. This Act may be cited as the Municipal Councils and
Urban Counc1ls (Amendment) Act, No 39 of 1986.

_PARTI ...,

2. Section 10 of the Mun1c1pa1 Councils Ordmance
(hereinafter in this Part referred to as the - “principal

enactment ), as last amended by Act No 2 of 1967 is’

hereby further amended as follows: X

() in subsection (1) of that section, by the substitution,
for all the words from ‘“and shall expire on the
thirty-first day of December ” to the end of that sub-
sectmn of the followmg R S i

“and shall, unless such counc1110r vacates office
earlier by death, resignation or removal continue
for a period of forty eight months from the date
on which such term of office commenced.” ; and

(b) by the repeal of subsection (2) thereof and the sub-
sitution therefor of the following subsection : —

¢ (2) The Minister may by Order pubhshed in the
g Gazette—:

(a) curtail the term of ofﬁce referred to in
. subsection (1) by appointing, in substi~
tution for the date on which the term
of office expires, a day of any month
; , preceding the month on which such
«ito wowe oo o term of office expires in that year or in
~ the year 1mmed1ate1y precedmg that
- year ; and :

(b) extend such term by appointing, : in
substitution for the date on which the

s ' _ter_m of office expires, under subsection
. (1) or the day appointed under para-

Shorti titis.

Amendment
of :

section 10 of |

Chapter 2% .

. graph (e) of this subsection, a day of -

any month after the day on which the.

& 092362 (86/11)



2 Kunicipal Councils and Urban Councils
(Amendment) Act, No. 39 of 1986

term of office expire in that year or in

any year subsequent to the year
so specified or appointed, and there-

-after from time to time extend
such term by appointing in substitution
for the date of expiry of such term
specified in the last Order, a later date:

Provided, however, that the period
by which such term is extended or the
aggregate of the periods by which such
term is from time to time extended
shall not exceed twelve months. ”.

Amendment of 3. Section 40 of the principal enactment as amended by

ﬁ“g{.‘mﬁpﬁ + Act No. 13 of 1983, is hereby amended in subsection (1) of

enactment. that section, by the substitution for paragraph (uu)
(inserted by Act No. 13 of 1983) of that subsection of the
following paragraph:—

*'% (wuu) with the prior approval of the Minister—

. (i) to engage in commercial and industrial enter-
prises for the manufacture and production of
such machinery, equipment, articles, materials
‘and goods as may be required for the public

.. services or the public utility services, as the

case may be, which may be established and

“ maintained by any Municipal Council or

Urban Council under the Municipal Councils

. Ordinance and the Urban Councils Ordinance
‘or under any other written law ; and

(11) to sell such machinery, equipment, articles,

_ materials or goods to any other Municipal
Council or Urban Council or to the public at

such:prices as may be determined by the
Counc11 and approved by the Minister.”.

Amendment of 4 Sectlon 7? of 1he principal enactment is hereby

gection 73 of

the principai  amended in’ subsection (2) of that section, by the substi-

enactment. tution, for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding
fifty rupees.”, of the words “on conviction to a fine not

exceedwng ﬁve hundred rupees.”. <

;&em&?gﬁgng foi 5. ‘Section 74 of - the. prmclpal enactment is hereby
the principa]l amended-in subsection (2) of that section, by the substi-
enactment, tution, for the words “ on conviction to a fine not exceeding

fifty rupees.”, of the words “on conwctlon to a fine not

exceeding five hundred rupees ”.



Municipal Councils and Urban Councils 8
(Amendment) Act, No. 39 of 1986

6. Section 78 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words * on conviction
to a fine not exceeding fifty rupees, and, in case of a con-
tinuing offence, to an additional fine not exceeding twenty-
five rupees ”, of the words “on conviction to a fine not
exceeding five hundred rupees, and in case of a continuing
offence, to an additional fine not exceeding two hundred and
ﬁfty rupees ”, -

7. Section 79 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “ on conviction
to a fine not exceeding fifty rupees” of the words “on
conviction to a fine not exceeding five hundred rupees. ”.

8. Section 81 of the principal enactment ishereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “ on conviction
to a fine not exceeding fifty rupees,”, of the words “on
conviction to a fine not exceeding five hundred rupees,”.

9. Section 83 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended as follows : —

(a) in subsection (1) of that section, by the substitution,
for the words “ on conviction to a fine not exceeding
fifty rupees:”, of the words “on conviction to a
fine not exceeding five hundred rupees: ”

(b) in subsection (2) of that section, by the substitution,
for the words “ on conviction to a fine not exceeding
fifty rupees ; ”, of the words “on conviction to fine

* not exceeding five hundred rupees;”;. - -

(c) in subsection (3) of that section, by the substitution,

... for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding

7 fifty rupees, and, in case of a contmumg offence, -to

."an additional . fine not exceeding twenty-five

_ rupees, ” of the words “ on conviction to a ﬁne not

exceedmg five hundred rupees, and, in ‘case of a

l' ‘._contlnutmg offence, to an add1t10na1 fine not excee-
¢ ding two hundred and fifty rupees”; and.

‘ (d) 1n subsectxon (4) of that sectxon by the substltutlon,j‘

0 for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceed-
7Y ing: fifty rupees. ”, of the words “on conviction to
a fine not exceeding five hundred rupees.”,

Amendment of
section 78 of
the principal
enactment.

Amendment of
section 79 of
the principal
enactment.

Amendment o4
section 81 of
the principal
enactment.,

Amendment of
section 83 of
the principal
enactment.



Amendment of

section
84 ot

the principal

enactment.

Amendment
of section
85 of the
principal
enactment.

Amendmest
of section
93 of the
principal
enactment.

Amendment
of section
101 of the
principal
enactment.

4 Municipal Councils and Urban Councils
(Amendment) Act, No. 39 of 1986

10. Section 84 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended as follows:—

(a) by the repeal of subsection (2) thereof, and the sub-
stitntion therefor, of the following subsection :—

% (2) No animal seized under subsection (1) shall
be delivered to the owner thereof unless upon pay-
ment of such sum as the Council having regard to
local conditions may by resolution fix, from time
to time, for the use of the person by whom the ani-
mal may have been seized, and for each day during
which the animal may have been kept in the
pound » + and :

(b) in subsection (3) thereof, by the substitution, for all
the words from “ and after payment of two rupees”
to “and maintained in the pound,” of the follow-
ing :—

“and after payment of such sums as the Council

~ having regard to local conditions may by resolution
fix from time to time, to the person by whom the
animal was seized and for each day during which

the animal may have been kept and maintained in
the pound, ”,

' 11. Section 85 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “ on conviction
to a fine not exceeding fifty rupees. ”, of the words “ on con-
viction to a fine not exceeding five hundred rupees. ”. "

12. Section 93 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “on conviction
to a fine not exceeding fifty rupees. ”, of the words * on con-
viction to a fine not exceedmg five m;edred rupees.

13 Section 101 of the pnnclpal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution. for the words “ on conviction
to a fine not exceeding fifty rupees and, in case of a conti-
nuing offence, to an additional fine not exceeding twenty-
five rupees”, of the words “on conviction to a fine not
exceeding five hundred rupees and in case of a continuing

offence, to an additional fine not excepdmg two hundred

and fifty rupees”.. -



Municipal Councils and Urban Councils 5
*(Amendment) Act, No. 39 of 1986

14. Section 102 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “ on conviction
to a fine noi exceeding fifty rupees, and, in case of a conti-
nuing offence to an additional fine not exceeding ten rupees ”,
of the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding five
hundred rupees, and in case of a continuing oﬁence to an
add1t10n31 fine not exceeding one hundred rupees

15. Section 103 of the prmc1pal enactment is hereby

amended in subsection (1) of that section, by the substitu- '

tion, for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding
one hundred rupees, and, in the case of a continuing offence,
to an additional fine not exceeding twenty-five rupees”, of
the words “ on conviction to a fine not exceeding -one thou-
sand rupees, and, in the case of a continuing offence to an
additional fine not excecding two hundred and fifty rupees”.

16. Section 104 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (1) of that section, by the substitu-
tion, for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding
one hundred rupees, and, in case of a continuing offence,
to an additional fine not exceeding twenty-five rupees”, of
the words “on convietion to a fine not exceeding one thou-
sand rupees, and, in case of a continuing offence 1o an addi-
tional fine not exceeding two hundred and fifty rupees”.

17. Section 105 of the px"-incipali enactment _is hereby
amended in subsection (2) of that section, by the substitu-
tion, for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding
one hundred rupees ”, of the words “on corivic_tion to a fine
not exceedmg one thousand rupees. s | .

18 Sectxon 106 of the prmclpal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (2) of that section, by the substitu-
tion, for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding
two hundred and fifty rupees. ”, of the words “ on conviction
to a fine not exceeding two thousand. five hundred rupees. ”,

19. Section 107 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection' (2) of that section, by the substitu-
tlon for the'words “ori econviction to a fine not exceeding

one hundred rupees.”, ” of the words “on conviction to a

fine not exceeding oné thousand rupees.”

7is P
G RS

Amendment -
of section
102 of the
principal
enactment.

Amendment
of section
103 of the
principal
enactment,

Amendment
of section
104 of the
principal
enactment.

Amendment
of section
105 of the
prircipal
enactment.

Amendment
of section
106 of the
principal
enactment,

Amendment
of section
107 of the
principal
enactment.



Amendment
of section
108 of the
principal
enactment.

Amendment
of section
109 of the
principal
enactment,

Amendment
of section
110 of the
principal
enactment.

Amendment
of section
111 of the
principal
enactment,

Amendment
of section
112 of the
principal
enactment,

6 Municipal Councils and Urban Councils
(Amendment) Act, No. 39 of 1986

20. Section 108 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (3) of that section, by the substiiu-
tion, for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding
fifty rupees.”, of the words “on conviction to a fine not
exceeding five hundred rupees. ”.

21, Section 109 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (11) of that section, by the substitu-
tion, for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding
fifty rupees.”, of the words “on conviction to a fine not
exceeding five hundred rupees. ”.

22, Section 110 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended as follows :— :

(a) in subsection (5) of that section, by the substitution,
for the words “on conviction be liable to a fine not
exceeding one hundred rupees;” and “on convic-

" tion be liable to a fine not exceeding twenty-five

rupees *, of the words “ on conviction be liable to a

_fine not exceeding one thousand rupees ;” and “on
conviction be liable to a fine not exceeding two
hundred and fifty rupees  respectively ; and

7' (b) in subsection (7) of that section, by the substitution,

« for the words “on conviction be liable to a fine not

- exceeding one hundred rupees. ”, of the words “on

conviction be hable to a fine not exceedlng one
thousand rupees.”

23. Section 111 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (4) of that section, by the substitu-
tion, for the words “on conviction be liable to a fine not
exceeding one hundred rupees;” and “on conviction be
liable to a fine not exceeding twenty-five rupees”, of the
words “on conviction be liable to a fine not exceeding one
thousand rupees;” and “on conviction, be liable to a fine
not exceeding two hundred and fifty rupees” respectively.

24. Section 112 of the principal enactment is: hereby
amended as fol]ows -

(a) in subsection- (4) of that sectlon by the substltutlon,
for the words “ on conviction to a fine not exceeding

. fifty rupees. ™, of the words “on conviction to a fine

not exceeding five hundred rupees.” ; and

o



Municipal Councils and Urban Councils 7
(Amendment) Act, No. 39 of 1986

(b) in subsection (6) of that section, by the substitution,
for the words “ on conviction to a fine not exceeding
fifty rupees.”, of the words “on conviction to a
fine not exceeding five hundred rupees.”.,

25. Section 113 of the principal eanctment is hereby
amended in subsection (2) of that section, by the substitu-
tion, for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding
one hundred rupees. ”, of the words “ on conviction to a fine
not exceeding one thousand rupees.”.

26. Section 115 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (2) of that section, by the substitu-
tion, for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding
fifty rupees ” and “on conviction be liable to a fine not ex-

ceeding twenty-five rupees ”, of the words “on conviction:

to a fine not exceeding five hundred rupees” and “on con-

viction be liable to a fine not exceedmg two hundred and-
fifty rupees” respectively. : :

27. Section 116 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (1) of that section, by the substitu-
tion, for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding
fifty rupees ;™ and “ on conviction be liable to a fine not ex-
ceeding twenty-five rupees”, of the words “ on conviction

to a fine not exceeding five hundred rupees ;” and “on con-:

viction be liable to a fine not exceedmg two hundred and
fifty rupees”, respectively. - '

2. Section 117 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (6) of that section, by the substitu-
tion, for the words “ on conviction to a fine not exceeding
fifty rupees;” and “on conviction be liable to a fine not
exceeding twenty-five rupees”; of the words “on convic-
tion to a fine not exceeding five hundred rupees ;* and “on

conviction be liable to a fine not exceeding two hundred

and fifty rupees”, respectively. '~

29. - Section 118.of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (2) of that section, by the substitu-
tion, for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding

fifty rupees. ?, of the words “ on conviction to a fine not ex- J

ceeding five hundred rupees.”.

Amendmenti
of section
113 of the
principal
enactment

Amendment
of sectionr ..
115 of the
princinal

enactmeny

i

=i

Amendment
of section "
116 of the .
principal
enactment ¢

Amendment
ot sectior
117 of the
pri:ncipa

enactment

Amendment
of section
118 of the
principai
enactment



Amendment
of section
119 of the
principal
enaciment.

Amendmer

of section
120 of the
principal

enactment,

Amendment

of gection
121 of the
principal

enaciment,

Amendment

of section
124 of the .
principal
enactment.

Amendment
of section
127 of the
principai

enactment. e

Amendment
of section
134 of the
principal
enactment.

Amendment

ol section

135 of the . /

priacipal

enactment.

8 Municipal Councils and Urban Councils
(Amendment) Act, No. 39 of 1966

30,  Section 119 of the principal enaciment is hereby
amended in subsection (3) of that section, by the substitu-
tion, for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding
two hundred rupees.”, of the words “on conviction to a

fine not exceeding two thousand rupees.”.

31. Section 120 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (2) of that section, by the substitu-
tion, for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding
one hundred rupees.”, of the words “on convictien to a fine
not exceeding one thousand rupees.”.

32. Section 121 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (2) of that section, by the substitu-
tion, for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding
fifty rupees ;" and “on conviction to a fine not exceeding
twenty-five rupees ”, of the words “on conviction to a fine
rot exceeding five hundred rupees;” and ‘on conviction
to a fine not exceeding two hundred and fifty rupees”, res-
pectively.

33. Section 124 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “ on conviction
to a fine not exceeding twenty-five rupees”, of the words
“on conviction to a .fine not exceeding two hundred and

fifty rupees‘ Ty ‘ _ : ; fe et e

34, Sectlon 127 of the prmclpal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (3) of that section, by the substitu-

~ tion, for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding

{wenty-five rupees”; of the words “on conviction to a fine

., not exceeding two hundred and fifty rupees”.

35. Section 134 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “ on conviction
to a fine not exceeding ten rupees. ”, of the words “ on con- '
viction to a fine not exceeding one hundred rupees.”.” = !

36. Section .135. of the principal enactment. is ‘hereby
amended in subsection (2) of that section, by the substitu-
tion, f~~ the words “ on conviction to a fine not exceeding’
fifty rupees.”; .of the words “ on' convietion" to a ﬁne not
exceedmg five hundred rupees.”.. oot bohond avi gribes



Municipal Councils and Urban Councils 9
(Amendment) Act; No. 39 of 1986

- 37, - Section 136 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words * on conviction
to a fine not exceeding fifty rupees, and, in case of a conti-
nuing offence, to an additional fine not exceeding ten
rupees ”, of the words “on conviction t0 a fine not excee-
ding five hundred rupees, and, in case of a continuing

offepcb, to an addvtlonal fine nnt exceedlng one hundred
rupees.’ ~

38. Section 136a of the principal ' enactment, (inserted
by Act No, 42 of 1979) is hereby amwended in subsection

(1) of that section, by the substitution, for the words * with-
in the administrative limits of the Colombo Municipal
Council, ” of the words “ within the administrative limits
of any Municipal Council.”..

39. The following new section is hereby inserted imme-
diately after section 136A of the principal enactment and
shail have effect as section 1368 of that enactment :—

“Power of the  1368. (1) Where in any Municipal Coun-
Mayor in

- regard to cil area any tree or any branch, trunk, fruit
fbrf:r?cgis or other part of a tree is causing or ig likely
trunks or to cause damage to any building, or is in a
ggi\;s :rfdan condition dangerous to the occupants of any
gering the - building, or {o the safety of passers by along .
safety of

any public thoroughfare, the Mayor may, by
person or ; ; s
property. a notice in writing served on the owner or
occupier of the land on which such tree
~ stands require such owner or occupier to tie
up and make secure, or to cut down and re-
move such tree or the branch, trunk, fruit
or other part of such tree Wlthln such tlme
as may. be spemﬁed in the notice.

(2) Every person on whom a notlce is
’served under subsection (1), shall comply

" “with the requirements of such notice within

the time specified therein, and in the event
of the refusal or neglect of such persons to
"“comply with such requirements within such

" time, the Mayor or any officer or workman
authorized: in writing in that behalf by the

.. . Mayor, may enter upon the land referred to
“in such rotice and do what such person was

" required to do by such notice, and the expen-

" ' ses thereby mcurred may be recovered from
- such'person as a debt due to the Council.”.

Amendment
of section :
136 of the
principal

enactment.

Amendment
of section
136a of the
principal
enactment., .

Insertion of
new gection
1368 in the
principal
enactment.



Amendment
of secuion
137 of the
principal
enactment.

Amendment
of section
139 ot the
principal
enactment.

Amendment
of section
140 of the
principal
enactment.

Amendment -

of section
141 of the -
principal
enactment.

Amendment
of section
158 of the
principal
enactment.

Amendment
of section
159 of the
principal
enactment.

Amendment
of section
180 of the
principal
enactment.

Amendment
of section
188 of the
principal
enactment.

10 Municipal Councils and Urban Councils
(Amendment) Act, No. 39 of 1986

40. Section 137 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (3) of that section, by the sub-
stitution, for the words *on conviction to a fine not
exceeding five hundred rupees,”, of the words “on
conviction to a fine not exceeding five thousand rupees: ”

41. Section 139 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “ on conviction
to a fine not exceeding fifty rupees: “, of the words “on
conviction to a fine not exceeding five hundred rupees: ”.

42. Section 140 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (1) of that section, by the subsitu-
tion, for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding
fiity rupees,”, of the words “on conviction to a. fine not
exceeding five hundred rupees, ”.

- 43. Section 141 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “ on conviction
to a fine not exceeding one hundred rupees. ”, of the words

“on conviction to a fine not exceedmg one thousand
rupees % g

44. Section 158 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “ on conviction
to a fine not exceeding fiity rupees.”, of the words “on
conviction to a ﬁne not exceeding five hundred rupees. ”,

45 Sectlon 159 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “ on conviction
to'a fine not exceeding twenty rupees. ”, of the words “on
conv1ct10n to a fine not exceeding two hundred rupees &

46 Sectlon 180 of the pr1nc1pa1 enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “on conviction
to a fine not exceeding five hundred rupees.”, of the words

“on conv1ct10n to a fine not exceedmg ﬁve thousand
rupees e

‘47 Section 188 of the Vpr'incipal Venalctment as last
amended by Act No. 61 of 1981, is hereby further amended
in subsection (1) of that section : —

_(a) by the substitution in paragraph (1) of that subsec-
) tion, for the words “ not exceeding in the agoregate
. one thousand rupees ”, of the words * not exceeding

~ in the aggregate ten thousand rupees, ” ; and



Municipal Councils and Urban Councils 11
(Amendment) Act, No. 39 of 1986

¥ (b) by the insertion, immediately after paragraph (n) of
that subsection, of the following new paragraph :—

© “ (nn) all expenses incurred by the council in the
installation and maintenance of official
telephone facilities to the residence of the
Councillors ; ~.

48. Section 196 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (5) of that section, by the substitu-
tion, for the words “to a fine not exceeding two hundred

and fifty rupees, ”, of the words “to a fine not exceding
two thousand five hundred rupees, ”.

49. Section 221 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substituticn, for the words “ on conviction
to afine not exceeding one hundred rupeesandtoan addi-
tional fine not exceeding fifty rupees”, of the words “on
conviction to a fine not exceeding one thousand rupees and
to an additional fine not exceeding five hundred rupees”. ”

30. Section 227 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended as follows :—

(@) by the substitution, for the words “expenditure of
© not more than one thousand five hundred rupees, ”,

of the words “ exvenditure of not more than fifteen
thousand rupees,” ; and

- (b) in the marginal note to that section, by the substitu-
tion, for the words “one thousand five hundred
rupees ”, of the words “ fifteen thousand rupees ”.

51. Section 228 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended as follows :—: -

" (a) by the substitution, for the Words' “expenditure of
more than one thousand five hundred rupees, ”, of

the words. “ expenditure of more than fifteen
thousand rupees, ; and

(b) in the marg inal note to that sectron, by the substltu-
tion, for the words “one thousand five hundred
rupees ”, of the words “ fifteen thousand rupees ”.

' 52. Section 230 of the principal enactment as last
amended by Act No. 20 of 1985, is hereby further amended
by the repeal of the subsectxon 1mmeda1tely after subsectlon
(2) of that section. s

Amendment
of section 3
196 of the
principal
enactment.

Amendmend
of section .
221 of the -
principal '’
enactment.

Amenament
of section

227 of the . ..
principal _
enactment. - -

Amendment |
of section
298 of the
principal
enactment,

Amendment
of section
230 of the
principal
enactment



Amendment
_ of section
234 of the
principal
enaciment.

Amendment
of section
247 B of the
principal
enactment.

Amendment
of section 24T¢
of the
principal
enactment.

Amendment
of section 247e
of the
principal
enactment.

Amendment
of section 251
of the
principal
enactment.

Amendment
of section 253 -

of the
principal
enactment.

12 Municipal Councils and Urban Councils
(Amendment) Act, No. 39 of 1986

53. Section 234 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (3) of that section, by the substitu-
tion, for the words “on conviction to a fine not exceeding
one hundred rupees.”, of the words “on conviction to a
fine not exceeding one thousand rupees.

54, Section 2478 of the principal enactment (inserted
by Act No. 42 of 1979) is hereby amended in subsection (4)
of that section, by the substitution, for the words * the
Council shall report” and “such Council is situated.”, of
the words “the Commissioner shall report” and “the
Council is situated.” respectively. :

55. Section 247c of the principal enactment (inserted
by Act No. 42 of 1979) ag amended by Act No. 20 of 1985 is
hereby further amended in subsection (3) of that section,
by the substitution, for the words “the Council shall
report ” and “such Council is situated. ”, of the words “ the
Commissioner shall report” and “the Council is situated.”
respectively.

56. Section 24TE of the principél enactment (inserted

- by Act, No. 42 of 1979) as amended by Act No. 20 of 1985 is

hereby further amended in subsection (2) of that section,
by the substitution, for the words “the Council shall
report ”, of the words “the Commissioner shall report ”.

'

57. Section 251 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “on conviction
to a fine not exceeding fifty rupees. ”, of the words “ on con-
viction to a fine not exceeding five hundred rupees.”.

58. Section 255 of the principal enactment as Jast
amended by Act No 42 of 1979 is hereby further amended
as follows — " _

(a) in paragraph (c) of that section, by the substltutlon,
for the words “a charge not exceedmg five cents”,
of the erds “g charge not 'exce‘e'ding séventy-ﬁve
rupees” ;

(b) in paragraph (d) of that section, by the substitution,
' " "“ for the words “a charge not exceedmg seventy-five
f.‘ Cents , of the words “a charge not exceeding

seventy-ﬁve rupees ”; and noltona ey 1o (L)



Municipal Councils and Urban Councils 13
(Amendment) Act, No. 39 of 1986

:; (¢) in paragraph (e) of that section, by the substitution,
for the words “ a charge not exceeding twenty-five
cents ”, of the words “a charge not exceedmg one
rupee ” ~ \

59. Section 256 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “ one thousand
rupees ” wherever those words appear in that section, of
the words “ ten thousand rupees ”.

60. The following new section is hereby inserted imme-
diately after section 266 of the principal enactment and
shall have effect, as section 266A of that enactment :—

“Waiver of 266Aa. The Council may by resolution

fg?},‘sed“e waive the whole or any part of any sum of
Council, money (not being a sum for the waiver of

which provision is made by subsection (2)
of section 252) due to the Council from any
person if it appears to the Council that the
amount to be waived is inconsiderable or
irrecoverable or that it should be written off
on the ground of the poverty of the person
liable therefor. Every such resolution rela-
ting to the waiver of an amount exceeding
one thousand rupees shall be subjert to the
- approval of the Minister.”,

61. Section 297 of thé principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “ on conviction
thereof to a fine not exceeding fifty rupees”, of the words

“on conviction thereof to a ﬁne not exceedmg five hundred
rupees ”, kR \

. 62, Section 299 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (3) of that section, by the substi-
tution, for the words “on nonviction to a fine not exceeding
ﬁfty rupees ”, of the words “on conviction to a fine not ex-
ceedmg five hundred rupees”, . i .4

53 Sectlon 308 of the prmc1pa1 enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for' the Words “ within three
months next after the. commlssmn ”, of the words “ within
six months next after the commlssmn

Amendment

. of section 258

of the
principal
enactment,

Insertion
of new
section 2664
in the
principat
enactment.

Amendment
of section 237
of the
principal
enactment,

Amendment
of section 29%
of the
principal
enactment,

Amendment
of

section 308
of the
principal
enactmens,



{o the
principal
enactment,

Amendmeﬁt

of
section 10
of

Chspter 258,

14 Municipal Councils and Urban Councils
(Amendment) Act, No 39 of 1986

64. The Second Schedule to the principal enactment is
hereby amended in paragraph 2 thereof, by the addition
immediately after item (e), of the following new item :—

“ (f) the Explosives Ordinance, 1902.”.
PART II

65. Section 10 of the Urban Councils Ordinance (here-
inafter in this Part referred to as the * principal enact-

ment”) as last amended by Act No. 2 of 1967, is hereby
further amended as follows ;: —

(a) in subsection (1) of that section, by the substitution,
for all the words from “and shall expire at the

thirty-first day of December ” to the end of that
subsection, of the following :—

“and shall, unless such councillor vacates office

- earlier by death, resignation or removal continue

for a period of forty e ght months from the date on
which such term of office commenced.” ; and

(b) by he repeal of subsection (2) thereof, and the
substitution therefor of the following subsection : —

“ (2) The Minister may by Order pubhshed in the
Gazette—

(a) curtail the term of ofﬁce referred to in
.. subsection (1) by appointing, in sub-
stitution for the date on which the
term of office expires, a day of any
month preceding the month on which

such term of office expires in that year

~ or in the year immediately precedmg
that year; and . e i

(b) extend such term by appomtmg, in
-substitution for the date on which the
Lo g . term of office expires, under subsection
. . (or the day apvo.nted under para-
N © 7" " graph (a) of this subsection, a day of
" any month after the day on which the
term of office expires in that year or in
any year subsequent to the year so
specified or appointed, and thereafter
from time to time extend such term by
appointing in substitution for the date
of expiry of such term specified in the

-last Order, a later date: * - **"



Municipal Councils and Urban Councils 15
(Amendment) Act, No. 39 of 1986

Provided, however, that the period
by which such term is extended or the
aggregate of the periods by which such
term is from to time extended shall not
exceed twelve month. ”.

66. Section 36 of the principal enactment as amended by
Act No. 13 of 1983 is hereby further amended by the subs-
titution for paragraph (ii) (inserted by Act No. 13 of 1983)
of that section of the following paragraph :—

“' (iii) with the prior approval of the Minister—

(i) to engage in commercial and industrial enter-
prises for the manufacture and production of
such machinery, equipment, articles, materials
and goods, as may be required for the public
services or the public utility services, as the
case may be, which may be established and
maintained by any Municipal Council or
Urban Council under the Municipal Councils
Ordinance and the Urban Councils Ordinance
respectively, or under any written law ; and

(ii) to sell such machinery, equipment, articles,
materials or goods to any other Urban Coun-
cil or Municipal Council or to the public at
such prices as may be determined by the
Council and approved by the Minister.”.

67. Section 159 of the principal enactment, as last
amended by Act No. 48 of 1984, is hereby further amended
by the insertion immediately after paragraph (f) thereof,
of the following new paragraph :—

“(ff) all expenses incurred by the Council in the instal-
lation and maintenance of official telephone facili-
ties to the residence of the Councillors ;.

68. Section 160 of the principal enactment as last

amended by Act No. 20 of 1985, is hereby amended by the
repeal of subsection (4) of that section.

69. Section 1654 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (4) of that section, by the substitu-
tion, for the words “the Council shall report” and “such
Council is situated. ” of the words “ the Secretary shall re-
port ” and “the Council is situated.”, respectively.

Afmendmen‘:
o _
section 36
of the
principal
enactment,

Amendment
of

section 158
of the
principal
enactment,

Amendment
of

section 160
of the
principal
enactment,

Amendment
of

section 165a
of the
principal
enactment,



Amendment
of

section 1658
of the
principal
enactment,

Amenément
of

section 1650
of the
principal
enactment,

16 Municipal Councils and Urban Councils
(Amendment) Act, No. 39 of 1986

70. Section 1658 of the principal enactment (inserted by
Act No. 42 of 1979) as amended by Act No. 20 of 1985, is
hereby further amended in subsection (3) of that section,
by the substitution, for the words * the Council shall report *
and “ such Council is situated.”, of the words “ the Secre-
tary shall report” and *the Council is situated.” respec-

tively.

71. Section 165D of the principal enactment (inserted by
Act No. 42 of 1979) is hereby amended in subsection (2) of
that section, by the substitution, for the words ‘“ the Council
shall report ”, of the words “ the Secretary shall report ”.



	image00228
	image00229
	image00230
	image00231
	image00232
	image00233
	image00234
	image00235
	image00236
	image00237
	image00238
	image00239
	image00240
	image00241
	image00242
	image00243
	image00244

